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"Just because an

employee might not be
invigorated or dedicated
to his or her work on a
Monday doesn't mean he
or she won't be engaged
on Tuesday or vice
versa," said Culbertson.
"Additionally, one's work
can facilitate things at
home to a different
extent depending on the
day and what has hap-
pened on that particular
day." 

Stressing that engage-
ment refers to positive
work involvement rather
than more negative
forms of job involvement
like workaholism and
work addiction, which
have different effects on
home lives, Culbertson
said: 

"Work addicts, or
workaholics, have been
shown to experience
higher levels of work-
family conflict.
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