
B/G 1977 5' 3" Very pretty
Daughter studying for com-
puter Engineering degree
fluent in English seeks part-
ner a High officer of
Government. 0572229776.
G B19722 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 255219

PARENTS seek a partner for
their daughter 28 years,
BSc. Lady Teacher in
North-Western Province,
B/G-Employed, Partner
with good qualities. G
B19711 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 254752

ABOUT 5' 2 1/2" tall, fair,
very pretty daughter, cul-
tured, 'well mannered,
accomplished, educated
abroad. 34 years consider-
able assets, G/B well
established family seek a
very smart, tall well quali-
fied, well established son,
TT/NS from similar back-
ground. Proposals from Sri
Lanka, Melbourne
Singapore and England
considered. Differences
immaterial. Full details/con-
tact numbers first letter.
jacekz 9531@gmail.com G
B19693 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 253691

ACCOUNTANT /Doctor
below 32 years above 5' 8"
is sought by G.B.
Professional parents in U.K
for their 27 year old 5' 5"
fair, pretty doctor daughter
with impeccable character
born and educated Email
pms1810@gmail.com G
B19713 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 254875

AFFLUENT pretty looking
divorcee (40) from highly
respectable family
(Dehiwala) with no encum-
brances, presently residing
in Srilanka with American
citizenship, seeks partner
here or abroad. Proposals
with family details and
horoscope (no cheats) will
only be considered. G
B18471 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 237698

AN honest fair com, educat-
ed handsome Malay/
Muslim boy below 34 yrs. of
medium height & below 5'
8", drawing a good salary
from a decent family is
sought by an Islamic con-
verted mother for her pretty,
educated fair com, good
natured daughter of medi-
um height following Islam,
employed in a reputed
company, from a very
decent family for a quick
marriage. Contact:
4362350. G B19203
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 244248

BATTARAMULLA Buddhist
Mother seeks partner for
her daughter Attorney at
Law 31 yrs fair pretty 5' 1"
tall with assets reply with
horoscope. 2789954. G
B16997 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 217759

BUDDHIST Sinhalese family
expect decent gentleman
here or abroad for daughter
kind hearted religious
employed in Colombo 52,
5'1" looks young differ-
ences Immaterial
0112913351. G B19527
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 250197

CHRISTIAN Sinhalese
Mother seeks qualified
partner for fair pretty
daughter 39 years, educat-
ed at leading Colombo
school, employed at a pres-
tigious company. Other
details will be given later. G
B18545 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 238163

COLOMBO Buddhist govi
professional family seeks
educated groom (below 45
years) for their very beauti-
ful lawyer daughter.
Recently divorced as the
innocent party she is very
fair, very slim and very
young looking. She is 5' 4''
and 41 yrs.
Lawyer/Accountant/High
rank army officer (Major or
above) is preferred.
Divorced/Widowed grooms
without childern from previ-
ous marriage wiil be
cosidered. Tel.
0113084802, Email:
newsletters161@gmail.co
m G B13118 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 164532

COLOMBO Govi- Buddhist
family seeks educated
kind-hearted partner wid-
owed/ divorced below 58
yrs for their pretty young
looking 53, 5' 2", widow
with a teeange son. She
works  in a state bank,
owns substantial assets.
Reply with detail horoscope
for those having compati-
bale with Mesha lagna,
Sitha nekatha cages in
Shani eight & kuja two. G
B18631 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 238690

COMMITED Christian lady
with means seeking a simi-
lar partner below 60 years.
G B18549 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 238168

CONSULTANT Doctor (G/B)
in UK seeks companion/
partner. She is 50 years
old, divorced with 2
teenage sons. She will be
in Srilanka from April 2nd -
12th and can be contacted
on tel no: 2591389 or
email: yrkaru@hotmail.com
G B18804 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 239911

FATHER seeks a partner for
his younger daughter 27
years, BSc, employed in a
foreign country, pretty.
Father has come to Sri
Lanka If the partner is
Buddhist/Govi, Salagama
preferred. Tallying the horo-
scope is essential. 032-
2247726, 0322248975. G
B19712 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 254761

GALLE, Budhist Govi/Dewa
mother seeks for her
daughter 27, 5' 5" Beautiful,
Vidyapita English medium
science teacher. Following
an open university BSc
(Last year) a suitable son
employed a Doctor,
Engineer, Bank Staff. Late
Father was engineer, Has
two brothers. Write with
horesocpe No Malefics in
house 7. G B19697
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 254000

GOVERNMENT Employed
daughter age 31 - 5'
divorced, no children with
dowry, parents look for an
employed son/partner. G
B19010 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo

T 241518

GOVI Retd, parents seek
virtuons, sober executive
grade employed son for
their Galle,
Buddhist/Durawa daugh-
ter, 33, 5' 3'' English
teacher. College of
Education, following
external degree. Her only
sister is an engineer who
married to an engineer.
No malefics in horoscope.
saturn/Rahu in 12th
house. She owns proper-
ties over 15 million. send
datails with horescope. G
B19704 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 254385

HORANA B/G Mother seek
an acadamically profes-
sionally qualified son for
29 Chemistry graduate
daughter.  G B19709
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 254649

JAFFNA Tamil Christian
respectable parents from
Australia seek profession-
ally qualified Christian
partner below 38 years
with sober habits for other
excellent character
daughter PHD-Doctor 35
years 5' 3" Slim fair pretty
and pleasant. Inherits
house in Australia. Please
reply with family details.
by email to,
ctmb2011@gmail.com
T 199565

KALUTARA Suburb
Sinhala, Catholic father
seeks for his 39 year 5' 4
1/2" pretty daughter
employed in a high post in
state services, owning
house property, a suitable
handsome employed part-
ner.
geethanigeeth@gmail.co
m G B19680 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 252269

MALAY mother living in
Wattala seeks Malay/
Moor partner from a
respectable with sober
habits, age below 50
years for their daughter
unmarried 45 yrs 5' 5"
height, fair, dowry nego-
tiable. Contact:
0112959232. G B18939
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 240912

MATARA, Buddhist, Govi
Durawa mother seeks for
her Vegetarian daughter
28, 5' 2" an Educated per-
manently employed son in
Business. G B19700
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 254099

MOOR mother from
Kalutara District seeks
religious educated pleas-
ant partner from
respectable moor family
for her US citizen comput-
er degree holder son age
30, height 5' 8". Contact:
fathimanusrath85@gmail.
com G B19377
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 247128

MOOR well connected par-
ents from CP looking for a
religious professional or
educated business man
for daughter CIMA passed
finalist BBA (Special) 24 +
fair 5' 1" wears hijab. con-
tact
macmamsl@gmail.com G
B19522 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 249715

MOORS highly connected
well known professional
parents seek smart,
Westernised practising
Muslim professional part-
ner for only daughter.
Those already abroad and
established in chosen
professions but thinking
for home-made sophisti-
cated out-going smart
young lady for life partner
are welcome to respond,
she's 26, 5' 7" H, slim,
v.fair, kind-hearted socia-
ble religious yet mod, a
professional with BSc
Degree from Northambria
University (UK) , Spatial
Designing. G B19683
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 252383

MUSLIM father (Moor, Law
Graduate/MD of Export
Company), mother
(Revert to Islam, previ-
ously Hindu) seek for their
eldest daughter, under-
graduate, 26 years, 5' 6",
pretty, slim, tan complex-
ion, professional groom,
28 to 30 years, pre-
ferrably but not necessari-
ly from mixed parentage.
Contact:
ismeth.mohamed @hot-
mail.com G B18433
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 237335

MUSLIMS (Moor/Malay)
(Father/Son) Ex-Royalists
and bankers seek suitable
professionally well
employed life partner for
prestegious Colombo
Convent English educat-
ed daughter, talented,
well employed Senior
Executive, sociable,
friendly, reasonaby reli-
gious, 32 Y., 5' 2" H., slim,
fair, partner to be under
38 yrs, apppx. 5' 6" smart
Non alcoholic, from good
family, practicing Muslim,
bride inherits Colombo
suburbon properties. G
B19684 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo

T 252398

PARENTS are retired
teachers, Govi,
Buddhists, from
Balangoda, daughter is
employed in the govern-
ment service. She is born
in the latter part of 1983,
no malefic planets. Invite
a son who is in executive
grade. Facilities for stay-
ing is available.  G
B19687 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 252624

PARENTS seek a Tamil
Christian partner, profes-
sionally qualified, below
31 for their Doctor daugh-
ter, slim, fair 26 years.
Sinhala Christians also
considered. Please give
full details and contact
number. G B18789
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 239679

PARENTS seek an
employed, teetotaller son
for their daughter who is a
Govi-Buddhist, 32 yrs. 4'
11" tall and Management
Assistant of Government
Institution from
Ratnapura. She is legally
separated due to an
unsuccessful marriage.
No children. Write those
who have malefic planets
in the horoscope. Dowries
available. G B18676
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 238964

RATNAPURA,
Buddhist/Govi parents
seek employed partner for
daughter 1982, 5' 1½",
state employed,
Ratnapura suburbs pre-
ferred. 0457911742. G
B18626 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo

T 238650

RATNAPURA, retired par-
ents seek a partner for
their daughter, 28 years
5', fair, Chartered
Accountant, 'Jayapura'
Assistant Manager in a
company in Colombo.
Salary: nearly Rs.
100,000/- suitable partner.
Send details with horo-
scope copy & Tele Nos,
Engineer, Dr., or
Accountant preferred. G
B18593 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo

T 238430

RATNAPURA: Retired par-
ents seek a partner for
their daughter, born in
1983, Executive in a com-
pany, visiting Lecturer in a
campus B/G, pretty, suit-
able partner, tally horo-
scopes with 'Shani' - 7.
Send all details with horo-
scope copy and tele nos.
G B18441 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 237441

RESPECTABLE middle
class B/G family in
Colombo suburbs seek
educated well employed
partner for only daughter
born 81/05 5'ft fair pleas-
ant executive in leading
private Company. Please
write with horoscope and
details of son  and family.
Kuja/aavi +
Kalasarpayoga. horo-
scopes not compatiable.
G B19696 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 253829

RETIRED Executive father
seeks a partner for his
daughter, has pre-school
teacher education certifi-
cate (English), unem-
ployed, owner of a com-
pleted house, employed
partner or businessman,
kind person. She was
born in 1983, staying in
Maharagama, 5' 4'', B/G.
G B18446 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 237490

SINHALA Govi Catholic
parents from Canada
(Canadian Citizens) seek
an educated and a profes-
sionally qualified partner
for their university educat-
ed pretty and well man-
nered 28 years old daugh-
ter, presently employed in
a leading Canadian IT
Company. Please send all
details. Email to: lankal-
proposal@gmail.com G
B18442 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 237445

SOUTH B/K 23 + 5' 4"
Educated pretty employed
in a state Bank as an offi-
cial Kuja 07 retired senior
Executive presently busi-
nessman father and
teacher mother seeks a
well employed son as part-
ner. G B19685 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 252467

SOUTH Buddhist, Govi par-
ents seek their only
daughter 27, 5' 1"
Beautiful Agriculture grad-
uate. Research Assistant
studying for post gradu-
ate-A son on same caste,
Well Mannered executive
grade no Malefics. 041-
2283871. G B19699
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 254068

SOUTHERN Bodu/Govi
retired parents seek
Doctor Engineer or similar
status Educated son for
their Daughter 26, 5' 2"
Fair with science special
Degree hailing from a doc-
tor Engineer Lawyer
Family Background,
(RAHU-8) G B19688
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 252629

TRINCOMALEE Buddhist,
Karawa parents seek for
their 28 year 5' 3", pretty
daughter employed in the
accounts section of a pri-
vate establishment, a suit-
able handsome partner.
0112-751976. G B19202
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 244238

UPCOUNTRY Sinhala
Buddhist father business-
man mother retired
teacher seeks for daughter
1980 Aesthetic Graduate
teacher legally seperated
after a short marriage a
son educated and well
employed between 31-36
Age. Reply with HC. Copy/
G B19032 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 241753

I AM,  52 years, 5' 3" in
height, Buddhist, Landed
proprietor, has 2 cars,
house and property, sepa-
rated from 23 years. I was
alone until I finished my
responsibilities of my chil-
dren. I expect to marry
without delay. My invita-
tion is to an educated rich
lady who knows house
chores. Divorcees, wid-
ows, with/without children
considered. G G19681
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 252347

A Reputed businessman, 45
years old, close to
Colombo invites a very
beautiful woman for a
plain marriage. Taking
decisions alone is compul-
sory. Letters from parents
or others rejected.
Dowries or horoscopes
are not required at all.
Woman with one child or
divorcees considered.
Priority is given to very
young ones. Those who
are willing to live happily,
write. G G18548
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 238167

A fair, pretty and educated
doughter for a son 27
years, 5' 7" employed in
Australia  and having the
cityzenship there, B/G.
Write details with horo-
scope copy. 0112502305 G
G19179 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 243958

AN educated well brought
up, pretty daughter who is
willing to migrate to the
USA, is sought by a
respectable, well estab-
lished professional Sri
Lankan family, citizens of
the USA, for their son 23
years who is studying medi-
cine in the USA. He is a
well brought up handsome
young man, a non-smoker
with sober habits and good
Sri Lankan values. he will
graduate in 2014 and then
practice medicine in the
USA. marriage will be at
this time apply with horo-
scope and family details.
Strict confidentiality
assured. Please reply with
full family details and
horosope to jrb.223@hot-
mail.com G G19686
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 252505

An educated, well-employed,
handsome, never-married,
executive, 53, tall, fair,
TT/NS seeks a fair, pretty
slim proficient in English
partner, GB, born in 1972
with the following horo-
scope. Cancer, Leo,
Sagittarius, Pisces, Rahu,
sun & moon in 1st house &
Saturn in 5th house. Mars,
Saturn, Rahu & kethu,
should not be in 7th & 8th
houses. Family details &
horoscope essential in
reply. G G18702
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 239111

B/G parents seek a bride for
handsome 33 years old
Executive owns assets,
reply with horoscope. G
G18452 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 237560

BUDDHIST Govigama par-
ents from Colombo seek a
suitable partner for their 27
yrs. Old lawyer son who
owns house and property in
Colombo please reply with
family details and copy of
horroscope. G G19705
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 254479

BUDDHIST Karawa Parents
seek for their Computer
Engineer son born 1981
Oct, 5' 8" Foreign post
graduate, Handsome.
Teetotaler An educated
beautiful daughter. Son
comes to Sri Lanka on
Early April for an employ-
ment consider Govi Kula
Also. G G19698
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 254039

BUDDHIST, Govi parents
seek a lady doctor served
in Galle for their 31, BSc,
MSc (Moratuwa University)
Engineer son presently
serving as project engineer
at leading institute. G
G19701 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 254135

BURGHER Parensts seek
accomplished pretty.
Homely bride for handsome
son 31 yrs Holding senior
Management post in
Mercantile sector upcoun-
try.  G G19706 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 254543

CATHOLIC Sinhala parents
(K/G) seek educated
employed pleasant daugh-
ter between 25 and 29
years with respectable fam-
ily background (Caste,
Creed and Race no bar) for
son (age 31 years, 5' 7",
fair, handsome) He is a pro-
fessional in Pharmaceutical
marketing. Inherit fully fur-
nished house property
South Colombo. Please
indicate your email address
and contact telephone if
available and respond to
keith.ranbaxy@yahoo.com
G G18721 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 239196

COLOMBO - I am a loving,
understanding nice person
looking for a female life
partner. Please reply
swgws7@yahoo.com G
G19254 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 245014

COLOMBO City suburbs
Bodu/Wishva parents seek
suitable compatible
Wishwa partner for their
eldest son in the family, 39,
5' 3'' handsome and fair,
educated upto GCE A/L,
specialised in gemology,
owner of a Gem and
Jewellery business shop, a
house and a car. Kuja 7,
Rehena nekatha. Send full
datails with horoscope. G
G19710 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 254696

COLOMBO, G/B widowed
mother (retired Principal)
seeks well educated, fair,
slim, pretty daughter (below
30 yrs and Kandy pre-
ferred.) from a similar back-
ground for her well estab-
lished finance professional
son, non smoker, with
sober habits 33 yrs, 6' and
handsome, divorced after a
short marriage, no encum-
brances (mutual separa-
tion). Should be willing to
reside/commute abroad
when required. He inherits
valuable assets in and out
of Colombo. Please write
with horoscope/family
details. Overseas propos-
als considered. Email:
indranie1950@gmail.com
G G19410 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 247618

COLOMBO, over 50, hand-
some kind widower retired
sales executive own house,
seeks partner for marriage.
0112704615. G G18479
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 237751

G.B. Father from South
seeks educated daughter
from respectable family for
son in Dental Proffession
having his own Dental
Clinic in Sweden. 5 feet 6
inches, 44 years. Only
those willing to reside in
Sewden need apply. Son in
Srilanka end August. G
G18602 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 238514

GAMPAHA Bodu/Govi par-
ents seek very attractive
pleasing educated daugh-
ter not above 26 yrs, Height
above 5' 4" for their son 28,
6, 5' 11" hailing from a
respectable ancestral  fami-
ly Electrical Engineer,
Doctor Banker preferred.
Send true details with
phone number and
Horoscope in first letter.
spanprop2011@yahoo.co
m G G19678 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 252133

GOVI Buddhist parents
Cololmbo father retired
Senior Government
Executive seeks suitable
partner for their handsome
26 years son, height 5' 10",
employed in leading private
bank, an educated fair pret-
ty girl with a pleasing per-
sonality. Owns house in
Colombo and luxury vehi-
cles. Graduated from an
Australian University and
possess Australian PR and
intends going to Australia
after marriage. G G18887
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 240530

KANDYAN Govi Buddhist
retired teacher parents
seek a suitable partner for
their 5' 8" tall 38 yrs old eld-
est son Ph.D. Holder work-
ing in a European
University. Separated after
registration. G G18523
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 238072

MOORS, Negombo educat-
ed parents seek for smart
experienced partly qualified
accountant son presently
working as Acting
Accountant in Doha with
steady income a pretty edu-
cated suitable tall bride 30
under, from a respectable
family. He is 35 yrs, 5' 8" H.,
well built, is a fellow mem-
ber of Book Keepers (UK)
Diploma Accountancy from
Accountants (UK). G
G19682 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 252369

MOUNT Lavinia G/B 50
years bachelor employed
owns modern house seeks
humble pleasant partner
horoscpe essential G
G19689 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 252727

MUSLIM Moor mid fifties
from Colombo Travel
Agent/ Accountant, Royalist
seeks suitable partner.
Email:
fm427lk@yahoo.com G
G19721 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 255213

PARENTS seek a suitable
partner for their son who is
Govi Buddhist from Up-
Country, Feb: 1976, 5' 1"
tall, self-employed (his own
business), having house
with all amenities, land
owner, respectable family
and pleasant look. Central
province. Kandy District
more suitable. samanthilak-
mali@yahoo.com G
G18876 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 240484

RATNAPURA 1976 year
born 5' 11'' handsome
tuition teacher and teacher
in an international school
in English language,
Diploma holder in literature
owning house facing A 4
main road and 30 perch
land and a motor cycle,
monthly income over Rs.
30000/-, seeks suitable
partner. Those owning
horoscope matching
Mesha Lagna, Moon Mars
in 02 Rahu 7 may only
write. G G19419
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 247774

RATNAPURA, a partner is
sought for the son 25
years, 5' 5", employed in
Navy, B/G, Lawyer,
teacher, fair, wanted the
horoscope copy and Tele
No. G G18422 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo
T 237258

RATNAPURA, retired father
seeks a partner for their
only son in the family born
in 1985, 5' 3", handsome,
Software Engineer,
employed in a company
(Foreign), owner of a
house and land worth mil-
lions, B/G partner, Doctor,
Engineer, teacher, around
Ratnapura preferred. Send
horoscope copy. G
G18598 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 238469

RETIRED Karawa Catholic
parents seek a partner for
their son citizen of
Netherland working as a
technical officer age 49
years 5' 7" looks younger
owns a house with 40P
land and bank deposits
coming on vacation early
April. Email:
suraweera@hotmail.nl G
G19719 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 255068

WELL to do Muslim smart
tall teetotaller out-going
retired gentleman seeks
mild mannered lady
around age 45-60 with a
view to marry if mutually
compatible. Pls reply with
phone number. G G19276
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo
T 245296

BRIDE & GROOM

MOOR Parents seek they
proposal daughters and
sons good partners asset
in Colombo. Contact
Mothalif Master Nukah
service. 0112387834. after
3 p.m.  G BG17089
C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 218315
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