
Printed and published by Wijeya Newspapers Ltd. on Sunday November 20, 2011 at No. 8, Hunupitiya Cross Road, Colombo 02.

CATHOLIC Karawa Sinhalese parents seek a
suitable partner for their daughter 30 years,
5'4", slim, medium fair, currently employed in a
reputed foreign bank as a Staff Officer. She
holds a degree in bachelor of Buss. Admin
(BBA) and ACMA (CIMA-UK). Inherit substan-
tial assets including house & property.
Preferably a partner with similar family back-
ground. Please reply with full details. E-mail:
pbaperera@yahoo.com G B54134 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 733438

37 Yrs 5'5" non religious, no voilent B.Sc
Teacher looking for someone for early mar-
riage. Please Call. 011 2951985, or har-
shipunchi@yahoo.com G B54139 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 733813

AFFLUENT well connected G/B family seek a
tall, handsome professional, with a smart per-
sonality, TT/ NS well  educated finacially well
established from Sri Lanka, From similer social
back ground for doughter, 34, very attractive
fair slim professional. Cultured accomplished
excellent command in English. Signature only,
short marriage, innocent party and those who
wish to settle down in S/L considered pabis70
@gmail.com G B55695 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 753474

B/G Business family seeks professionally well-
employed partner below 42 from Colombo sub-
urbs for educated pretty daughter born 1974,
5' 4" dowry includes 30m worth assets, car and
fixed monthly income over Rs. 60,000/=. Reply
horoscopes with kuja 1, 7, 8, 12 houses Ma
Nekatha G B55662 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 752317

BODHU/Salagama Colombo parents seek suit-
able partner for their daughter fair slim 23+ 5',
4" currently following a Business IT degree.
Reply with horoscope email-
kanisplit@yahoo.com G B54136 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 733523

COLOMBO Buddhist govi professional family
seeks educated groom (below 45 Yrs) for their
very beautiful lawyer daughter. Recently
divorced as the innocent party.
Lawyer/Accountant or a high rank Army officer
(Major or above) is preferred. She is very fair,
very slim and very young looking. She is 5' 4"
and 41 yrs. Divoced/ Widowed grooms without
children from previous marriage will be consid-
ered. Tel: 0113084802.
newsletters16@yahoo.com G B51819
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

702042

COLOMBO District Buddhist Govi 29 years,  5'
3” LLB (London) graduate lawyer/ lecturer
daughter. Parents seeks for a same cast part-
ner with permanent job and English knowl-
edge. With dowry, all details in first letter with
horoscope copy. G B55656 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 751874

COLOMBO Suburbs Buddhist/Govi parents
seek educated well-mannered son from a
decent family for their daughter 26, 5' 1" pretty
fair with M.B.B.S. (Foreign) degree own house
and other assets as dowry G B54484
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

736790

COLOMBO Suburbs G/B, Respectable parents
seek educated well mannered partner for their
31 yrs, 5' 3" pretty slim, fair daughter working
as a Director in a reputed company. Reply with
family details and horoscope.  G B54403
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

736317

DIRECTOR Brother seeks a well mannered and
same status Brother from any part of Sri Lanka
for his sister Buddhist Govi Beautifull 37 5' 5"
Textile diploma holder owns her own beauty
and Garmant Business new house and land
new vehicle good income. Write details with
horoscope from first letter.  G B55684
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 753251

EDUCATED family buddhist mother seeks a suit-
able partner (age between 40-47) for account-
ant daughter age 45, slim, very much young
looking with dowry, property in Colombo, cash
etc. difference immaterial. 0779984817 G
B55647 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo T 750417

G/B Daughter study in U.K 26. Mother seek edu-
cated good partner. 7 house Kuja- and  skura
G B55699 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo T 753596

G/B Doughter study in UK 26. Mother seek edu-
cated good partner 7 house Kuja and Sukra G
B55696 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo

T 753500

G/B respectable parents seek, kind hearted
employed educated, Businessman, C stable
economy, 48-53, for their daughter Grade C
Nursing Officer 5' 4" slim. pleasent, young
looking with dowry, widowers, divorcees, also
considered. TP. 3122498 G B55377
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 745786

GALLE Buddhist Govi Retired Father seeks suit-
able partner to his daughter 1978 September
born 5'  employed as a  Manager in the state
sector. Legally divorced after 6 months Married
life only. Brother is a lawyer. Cont. 091-
3930663. G B54406 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 736337

GALLE Town B/G Govt Employee parents seek
for their 29 year 5'1" pretty Management
Assistant daughter in a Colombo Govt. Dept.
Following a computer Engineering Course (5th
Year) in the Open University, a suitable hand-
some partner devoid of all vices. She has two
younger brothers. Horoscope essential G
B54405 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo T 736336

GOVI Buddhist parents from Colombo seek a
professionally qualified partner below 34 years
NS/TT from a respectable family for their pro-
fessionally qualified Daughter with good char-
acter and Buddhist values having substantial
assets. (Non Malefic Horoscope) brief mar-
riage (1 month) was annulled absoutely inno-
cent party. Apply with horoscope and family
details and contact telephone number or e-mail
to proposalkp@yahoo.com G B55160
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

742660

GOVI Buddist middle class family , seek a very
pretty kind  educated  daughters for engineer
son  , 35 yrs 5' 5 1/2" fair   handsome , kind.
Well educated NDT, CEL part 1 and 2 mtech in
Machanical, engineering, working in a multi
national company Colombo dowry and cast
immaterial for him Please send details to
thusitha.lk@gmail.com  G B55370 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 745718

GOVI Buddist respectable business parents of a
reputable company in Matale, seek, an acdem-
ically professionally qulified, well mannered
son for their only IT graduate daughter , 31 yrs
4' 11" fair slim working as an Accountant in
their company and a lecturer in a private
Institue. y.mathalerose@gmail.com G B55373
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

745751

GOVI Mixed parents seek a kind hearted educat-
ed empolyed son for their pleasant daughter
south 30, 5' Graduate tarinee for employment'
G B55663 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo T 752423

KALUTRA District mother seeks a partner for
her empolyed daughter aged 25. G B55664
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 752551

MATALE Buddhist Kandyan well connected fam-
ily seeks a groom for pretty daughter 29, 5' 3".
partly qualified in CIMA, only brother higher
studies in US, Kuja, Shani at 7 serious replies
with matching horoscopes.
proposals2matale@ gmail.com G B55651
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

750512

MATARA Buddhist Durawa Retired partents
seek for their teacher daughter 30.9 5' 1" BSc
Hon. special CIMA Qualified Slim beautiful a
son prefer Engineer, Accountant, Manager
Bank, Executive Sun, Mars, Mecury on 7 G
B55675 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo T 753080

MATARA Buddhist Govi Retired Teacher parents
seek a decent Employed same caste youth for
their only daughter pleasant Respectable 5' 3"
private Bank Officer Horoscope and Telephone
No Essential.  G B55682 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 753214

MATARA Buddhist mother seeks for her
Daughter 39 graduate holding higher post in
Ministry 5' 1" a son on some status or Business
man 1,7,8 Malefic Horoscopes reqired. No
Brokers. 041-2233572. G B55681 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 753204

MOTHER (Sinhala, Buddhist) Seeks a suitable
partner for her daughter who is 43 yrs old,
employed in a private Institute as an Executive
Officer, close to the Capital City, she is fair, of
good character and having dowry. No differ-
ences. Inquire with the Horoscope G B55645
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 750202

MOTHER from Govi Buddhist respectable well
connected family in the Gampaha District
seeks for her fair, tall, English educated, kind-
hearted, down to earth, attractive daughter
born in 1970 (Divorced) suitable partner, kind
and caring person with good family back-
ground willing to reside here or abroad.
Divorce with children, accepted. Reply with
horoscope and family details everything will be
treated as strictly confidential. C/o, The
Sunday Times. Email.buddhi38@hotmail.com
G B54727 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo

T 738445

MOTHER seeks a suitable partner for her
daughter Buddhist, Durawa Leaglly separated
after short marriage as a complainant, 47
young looking English teacher at Colombo
Leading School New house at Maharagama as
a Dowry.  G B55677 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 753113

MUSLIM Moor (Easter Origin) well connected
parents from Colombo seeking professionally  ,
qulified  groom for daughter 23, 5' 2" V fair and
pretty , BSc e-mail full details with contact
number to hafsa@soulmate.lk G B55693
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

753434

MUSLIM Moor Colombo well connected parents
seeking religious, educated, broad minded and
understanding groom for daughter 22, 5' 1"
LLB student, religious, well brought up e - mail
full details with contact number to hafsa@soul-
mate.lk G B55688 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX
2047 Colombo T 753400

MUSLIM parents seek for divorce daughter 30
yrs, height 5' 6" fair, pretty, slim, professionally
qualified in Travel/Tourism, working for a lead-
ing firm in Abu Dhabi. No encumbrances.
Expected groom should be 30-37 yrs, height 5'
7" d/m educated, kind hearted, moderately
sociable and religious and a firm employment
in Abu Dhabi or near. Detalis: mareena@jee-
vana.lk G B55648 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX
2047 Colombo T 750434

MUSLIM/ MOOR parents of Sri Lanka origin liv-
ing in UK seek  a suitably qulified groom/ part-
ner for their only daughter of 31 years old, 5
feet 8 ins. tall, born qulified and working in  UK
as a hospital doctor on specialist training. The
person sought preferably but not necessarily is
working at persent in UK and in any case he is
expected to be willing to relocate. Please con-
tact with full details on email: mode52@hot-
mail.co.uk G B55697 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 753521

PARENST seek a suitable son for their daughter.
South , buddhist Govi 29+ Software Engineer
G B55659 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo T 752220

PARENTS (B/C) seek a partner for their only
daughter, 27 years 5' - 6" employed
(Government) Graduate pretty, fair- suitable
partner she has a new two storeyed close to
Colombo. Brother is a doctor (Married) caste
immaterial.  G B54337 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 736017

PARENTS seek Educated Sober son for their
daughter Horana Buddhist 27 5' 2" Businss
Management CIMA completed Accounts
Executive at private institution horoscope
essential.  G B55674 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 753056

PARENTS seek a Beautifull daughter owns
dowry English medium teacher or having a
higher profession to Marry after one year to
their son Jayawardenapura 26 Charatered
Accountant consulstant (executive) in Leading
company in Colombo with Higher salary very
handsome. Pleasant. 5.10 old Anandian devit-
edto Buddhism and Arts only sister married
and living abroad. G B55657 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 751984

PARENTS seek a partner for their daughter 34
years, self employed staying in Rajarata B/G
partner who has a permanent job G B54779
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

738854

PARENTS seek a partner for their only daughter
32 years, 5'-4", Graduate (Commerce special),
Lawyer (L.L.B.), Notary Public, staying close to
Colombo B/G, Same caste, below 36 years,
suitable partner. 'Kuja' 'Chandra - 1. Send par-
ticulars with horocope copy G B54192
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

735023

RATNAPURA Bodu/Wishva parents seeks decent
son non smoking , teetoaller well employed or
with stable income from business for their pretty
, attractive daughter 24, 5' with  a/ level in
English medium owing dowry land with a house
and Substantial cash. Brother settled overseas
and sister studing in English medium .
Punawasa naketha and dewa gana  send
details with contact number and horoscope. G
B54391 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo

T 736239

RATNAPURA Bodu/Wishwa parents seek
Teetotaller  Non-smoking, Decent,
Doctor/Engineer, Executive or Business son, for
their daughter 1987 born, 5' 1'' pretty fair
English educated, owning land with house
assets cash and dowry eldest brother in
Australia. Younger sister doing education in
English medium. Punawasa Nekatha, Deva
Gana. Send details with Cont. No and
Horoscope G B54390 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 736237

RETIRED Mother seeks a partner for her daugh-
ter born in 1984, 5' 4" graduate (Software
Engineer) working in Colombo, B/G partner with
good qualities 'Puwasala Nekatha' send the
horoscope copy.  G B55395 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 746311

RETIRED Parents seek Govi Employed teetotaler
son for their daughter Matara, Budhist Dewa,
32, 5' 1" External under graduate - Ruhunu all
details with horoscope from 1st Letter.  G
B55680 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo

T 753187

RETIRED Parents seek a son holding an execu-
tive post employed in Colombo or suburbs aged
less than 35 for their pleasant daughter asst.
manager at an institution at foriegn university
MBA and post graduate 30, 5':6". She owns
substantial wealth. Inform facts with horoscope.
091-2243998. G B54416 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 736430

RETIRED Parents seek an educated son for their
daughter who has passed BSc - MBA (UK)
employed, having dowry, Born in 1982 she
intends to come to Sri Lanka in December
Contact. 011-2295752,
mengkumar@yahoo.com G B55661 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 752306

RETIRED Teacher mother seeks a son for her
daughter. South, Buddhist durawa grapic
designer pleasant 5' 4" 36 owned a house and
dowry her brother employed at hotel in Canada
as a chef' G B55665 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 752633

SOUTH Buddhist mixed Karawa and Govi parents
seek decent son involved with Business to their
daughter 33. 4' 8" Beautiful young looking stud-
ied at Girls's school owns dowry Mars7 - Asvida
Neketha Marriage with no encumbarances and
Children.  G B55679 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 753177

SRI LANKAN Baratha, Roman Catholic looking
for a professionally, academically qulified per-
son below 30 yrs of  age for their 25 yrs old
daughter. Slim 5' 7" height tan and holding an
academic and professional degree. Empolyed
in an out sourced establishment. Fluent in all
three languages. Reply with particulars of edu-
cation & family back ground to email:
antchrimel@gmail.com C/o : Sunday Times G
B55700 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo T 753603

UP-COUNTRY B/G parents seek for their 28 year
5' 2" pretty, dowry owning, daughter, presently
following a MBBS course in an approved foreign
University a suitable educated partner G
B54410 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo T 736391

UPCOUNTRY Buddhist Govi brothers, seek suit-
able sober partner for sister 44 yrs, 5' 1"
younger looking post graduate Teacher, pleas-
ant pretty and healthy possessing good dowry.
Contact with horoscope G B55014 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 740965

UPCOUNTRY Buddhist/Bathgama govt. employ-
ee 31 year old daughter (Divorced, No children)
father seeks suitable partner. G B54138
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

733550

WELL Accomplished Govi Catholic, 42 year old,
unmarried, female living in Ja-Ela, owning a
valuable house with substantial financial
resources seeks an unmarried kind handsome,
well employed partner below 48 years, for mar-
riage. Please reply with full details. Email:
clrabeyrathe@yahoo.com G B55668
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

752728

WESTERN Buddhist Govi parents seek hand-
some Doctor, Engineer, Executive Officer or
educated Businesman owned partner son for
daughter 5' 3" born '82 Oct, tan pleasant, Doctor
G B54616 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo

T 737526

\PARENTS Seek an educated , non-religious
handsome partner employed preferably in
Colombo, between the ages of 41-55 for their
daughter  43 years, BAC Hons, MSc, Teacher.
Legally divorced may reply and self-replies are
welcome. Reply with all family details and con-
tact number in first letter or e-mail. E-mail:
mproposal69@yahoo.com G B55705
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

753950

\RETIRED Parents seek for their only daughter
Matara Buddhist Karawa 27, 5.3 Beautifull kind
hearted Govi employed (QS) son same caste or
Govi permanently employed under 31 with
sober habits. Non malific horoscopes with
details. Matara Preferred.  G B55672
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

752971

ACADEMICALLY qualified fair pretty, well man-
nered kind hearted below 30 daughter, sought
by S/B/G mother for her 32 5' 9" handsome,
non-smoker professional post graduate quali-
fied son who's currently well settled in the UK.
Registration limited only for signature legally
cancelled. No encumberance. UK residents pre-
ferred. Confidentiality assured. Reply with horo-
scope. Family details and Contact numbers.
Email - jayamangalauk@gmail.com G G54395
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

736267

AFFLUENT Aunty in USA looking for partner for
Christian nephew 37 5' 9" in Sri Lanka. Self
employed well mannered, owns 2 story modern
house and rented properties. She must be
pelasent, simple , English speaking , employed ,
good family back ground. Age between 29-35.
Only Christians apply.  G G55703 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 753927

AN accomplished educated fair slim pretty profi-
cient in English partner G/B 41-46 years from
Colombo city/ suburbs is sought by an educated
, respectable well empolyed handsome never
married executive, 52 tall fair TT/Ns . Family
details and horoscope  essential in reply. G
G55676 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo T 753107

B/K Parents seek educated daughter for son 34
yrs height 5'-10" BSc (Informatics, Sri Lanka
MSc Deakin Australia) IT Software Engineer
working in Melbourne. Australian PR Holder,
prefer Karawa/Govi. Send family details/horo-
scope. Email - knsun50@yahoo.com G G54275
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

735599

BUSINESSMAN father and teacher mother seek
a partner for their son, 30 years, 5' 8",
Lawyer(Law College) and LLM (UK) employed
in UK, teetotaller a partner who wishes to go to
England. He has property. He comes to Sri
Lanka in December, first two weeks.
0384925713 or by Post. G G55669 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 752774

CHRISTIAN Beautiful bride is sought from an
English speaking family brackground for brother
who is a Christian, Govi, PR holder residing
abroad, having Acdemic and professional qulifi-
cations. He will be in Sri Lanka during 3rd week
of December. Bride needs to be an educated,
attractive and below 28 yrs who is willing to
reside overseas. Reply in detail including
Telephone number.  G G55689 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 753402

CHRISTIAN Tamil parents seek a suitable edu-
cated beutiful fair partner below 42 years, for
son 53 years, 5' 6" looks younger, Australian
Citizen, Educated in a Leading College in
Kandy Divorced after a short marriage spell
without children ethnicity immaterial. Apply with
details and Telephone. Number.  G G54617
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

737542

COLOMBO Suburb Buddhist Govi Retried Doctor
mother and Father seek for their only son 26 5'
10" Graduate Studying for MSc Executive in
leading company handsome Teetotaller having
non malefic horoscope owns 3 storied house
vehicles and lands a daughter doctor.
Engineers State Bank Officer.  G G55686
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

753276

COLOMBO Suburbs Buddhist/Govi Retired Bank
Officer father and Teacher seek mother educat-
ed well mannered partner for their son, 27, 5'
10" handsome well mannered, Management
Graduate Lawyer reading Chartered
Accountancy final exam, employed as an exec-
utive officer in a Private Institute at Capital City.
Send details with Horoscope G G54942
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

740264

COLOMBO- Parents seek a fair beautiful well
educated daughter for their only son, 28 years,
height 6' handsome outgoing  personality, pro-
fessionally qulified (CFAL1, CIMA, BBA) Well
employed as an investment analyst with
remarkable salary & assets. (8 Kuja, Shani)
Respond in English or Sinhala with family
details, copy of horoscope including a recent
photograph. ri21kumara@yahoo.com  All infor-
mation treated strictly confidential. G G55702
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

753907

EDUCATED beautiful daughter sought for a son
pleasant, decent, kind hearted living Colombo
suburb, Buddhist, Govi 26 5' 3" studied at
Colombo leading school and got higher educa-
tion in Australia and engaged business. He
owns business house and property, shops, vehi-
cles, No barriers. Contact with Horoscope.
0115728334 G G55078 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 741666

FAMILY from Colombo seek an English educated
Muslim groom Particing Islam with Strong faith.
Similar interests and an open mind for a pretty
English educated, employed, Muslim bride age
41 particing Islam, Who is interested in the arts,
reading, travelling and nature. Please email with
full details to:  786proposal11@gmail.com G
G54536 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo T 737008

G/B Professional parents Colombo Suburbs seek
educated pretty, well mennered dauther below
27 yrs for their son 29 yrs, 6' 2", Academically
and professionally qualified, owns house and
property, graduated from a reputed uni-
versity abroad, presently well employed
at a financial centre in Asia and visiting
Sri Lanka in December. Reply English /
Sinhal by post or e-mail with full details
and horoscope.
jayamini2011@yahoo.com G G54402
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 736305

GENTLMAN wishes to meet a slim, attractive and
accomplished lady arround 30-35 years, with a
view to marriage. He is 5' 7'', handsome and
through in his late thirties looks much younger.
He is a graduate and an author and works in the
creative field. The lady should be smart and
sociable, with a broad out look of life. e-mail:
mars@bellahansa.com G G54380 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 736183

GOVI Buddhist parents seek for their son living
with them in USA age 27 and 6 foot height, own
house in USA Florida and Nugegoda Sri Lanka
girl professionally and academically qualified
with similar background willing to live in USA G
G55090 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo

T 741771

GOVI Cathalic mother seeks a professionally
qualified partner for her only son 37 5' 9" BSc
Mechanical  engineer, Us citizen divorced inno-
cent party. no encumbrances. 0312238730
uditha1@sltnet.lk G G55111 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 742022

HINDU, Vellaler, Colombo based, respectable
parents seek for their smart son professional 32
years old, qualified in Australia (BSc, MSc,
C.P.A. ) an educated, attractive daughter. Tel.
2625254, 2633511 G G55653 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 750840

KANDY Buddhist Govi parents seek for their 29
year 5' 6" handsome MBBS (Sri Lanka) son
expecting Internship appointment, a suitable,
pretty dowry carrying bride from a respectable
family with higher education. Those from a dis-
trict closer to Kandy or from a girl migrated to a
foreign country preferred G G54622 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 737568

KANDYAN Bodu Govi mother seeks a pleasant
looking bride for her 34 year 6' teetotaller hand-
some son working in an Engineering firm
Colombo. 0777-372913. G G55281 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 744006

KURUNEGALA Buddhist/Govi prespectable par-
ents non residing in Colombo, seek pretty
decent daughter, from a respectable family,
employed or not, for their youngest son 27, 5' 5"
Asst. Bank Manager  Colombo - 3, attractive
salary, owning a vehicle new 2-storeyed build-
ing and assets over 20 million. Send details.
Cont. 0373879563. hamangoda@nmk.lk G
G54558 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo T 737129

LOOKING for lady to Marry below 40 yrs. Kind
honest, fair. Property, Caste immaterial widow,
Separated, Lonely considere Tel: 0115878852.
Ruwan505@yhaoo.com G G54571 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 737208

MOOR mother seeks religious bride below 30
years from Colombo. Her son 36 years busi-
nessman. Apply with full datails to
nikah1975@hotmail.com G G55706 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 753974

MOTHER Seeks kind hearted Daughter for her
youngest son, South Buddhist Govi, 32, 5' 11"
Slim pleasant permanently Employed at Air
Force owns house and property. Contact with
horoscope (Jupiter preferred) G G55673
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

753038

MOTHER seeks a beautifull decent daughter from
a normal family with or without employment for
her Handsome son Western Kottawa Buddhist
Govi 37 5' 5" Ministry field officer owns house
and assets young looking jupiter exalted Mars
12 Horoscopes preferred. Write those who
under. 33. G G55678 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo

T 753169

MUSLIM Moor Colombo well connected mother
seeking bride who is educated in a reputed
school in Colombo, smart, good looking up to
the trend and willing to migrate for son 32, 6' 0",
3 degrees  , working as a deputy CFO for a
reputed financial sector abroad. Email full
details with contact number to hafsa@soul-
mate.lk G G55692 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX
2047 Colombo T 753433

MUSLIM Widower retired BA 4k executive with
means no encumberances seek a religious
muslim partner widow un married. 0815629536
G G54970 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo T 740529

MUSLIM moor parents seeking religious,
educated, fair slim, tall ( above 5' 3" ) willing
to migrate a bride from Colombo for son 29, 5'
10" , Diploma ( Marketing) working abroad , well
settled E-mail full details with contact number to
hafsa@soulmate.lk G G55691 C/oSunday
Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 753420

MUSLIM parents seek for their son 30 yrs, 5' 7"
fair, moderately religious & moderately sociable,
BSc qualified (Marketing/Adv.) employed in
Australia. PR holder. Expected bride should be
educated, fair, pretty, age 24-27 yrs, height 5' 2"
d/m. Moderately religious, willing to migrate.
Details: mareena@jeevana.lk G G55649
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

750442

PARENTS Burgher/ Sinhala from Nugegoda are
looking for an educated, Born-again-Christian
bride below  27 years fair slim, and pretty,
height of about 5' 04" for their born-again-
Christian son an old Thomian who is 29 years of
age tall 5' 11" fair handsome and CIMA qualified
Senior manager of an international organization
in Colombo. Intersted partents are invited to
respond with all details, including a recent  pho-
tograph. G G55694 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX
2047 Colombo T 753472

PARENTS seek a partner for their son 30 years 5'
2" MSc (IT) living and employed in Australia,
B/G, Ada Nekatha Educated partner with good
qualities (around Colombo) send Tele Nos with
Horoscope copy.  G G55655 C/oSunday Times,
P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T 751245

PARENTS seek an educated daughter for their
son, born in 1986 , teetotalor, handsome, MBA
(U.K) passed having  a house vehicle and other
properties. He is an Engineer who expects to
come to Sri Lanka for employments in
December 0112295752
mengkumara@yahoo.com G G55660
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

752286

PARENTS seek educated beautiful kind hearted
suitable Daughter for the their son Avaisswella
Buddhist Govi, 29, 5' 6" Engineer, (BSc
Moratuwa) handsome. Contact with horoscope.
G G55080 C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047
Colombo T 741676

PARENTS seek partner who understand English
their deaf son employed as Executive in a reput-
ed comapny 35 years fair/ handsome 5' 9" Govi/
Christian Please reply with details. G G55698
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

753528

RETIRED Father (Deputy Principal) seeks a fair
charming good daughter for his son who is govi-
Buddhist, from Kandy (Udarata) 30 yrs, 5' 7"
tall, Chemical Technologist in building field,
(Salary Rs. 50,000/=). He is handsome, plesant,
having a house and land. She should be from
the same caste bank or Teacher preferred. 081
2219956 (Call after 7.00 p.m.) G G55013
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

740961

RETIRED Parents seek educated beautiful age
25-30 daughter for their younger son, south,
buddhist karawa 35 5.8" BSc, Employed in
London contact with horoscope and family
details . He comes to Sri Lanka on 1 st week of
December. shiranpjp@yahoo.com G G55670
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

752922

UPCOUNTRY Buddhist Govi graduate, holding
state higher position, 5' 7" 50 years, but
younger looking handsome musician possess-
ing property seeks sensitive minded beautiful
bride. Contact with horoscope G G55018
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

740992

WESTERN Province Buddhist Govi parents seek
partner daughter of an ordinary family for son
32 yrs coming to island after serving in America,
eldest and sober, younger brothers as doctors &
graduates, dowry not concerned G G54400
C/oSunday Times, P.O.BOX 2047 Colombo T

736297
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